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IMPORTANT
These dimensions are a guide only. All measurements are in millimetres (mm).
For complete installation instructions, refer to the manual provided with product.

westinghouse.com.au

Built in microwaves
WMB4425SC, WMB4425DSC

Product WxHxD (mm) 596 x 454 x 568

Flush mount cut-out WxHxD (mm) 600 x 466 x 570

15INSTALLATION

WARNINGCAUTION
Do not block the air vents. If you do that, the appliance  
can overheat.

WARNINGCAUTION
Do not connect the appliance to adapters or extension 
leads. This can cause overloading and risk of fire.

•   Model WMB4425DSC is for built-in use only.

•   The fitted cabinet must not have a back wall behind 
the appliance.

•   Put the appliance far away from steam, hot air and 
water splashes.

•   If the appliance is stored/ transported at sub-zero 
temperatures, do not activate it immediately after 
installation. Allow at least two hours for it to be brought 
up to room temperature before turning on the unit.

Installation - Built-in model WMB4425DSC

For the best integration within a kitchen, install this 
appliance in a standard 600mm wide cupboard that gives 
a flush fit with the surrounding cupboard fronts. A recess 
of 20mm is ideal.

The built-in cabinet must not have a rear wall behind  
the appliance. Do not cover ventilation slots and air  
intake points.

NOTE: Your appliance must be mounted on a flat surface 
for the full width and depth of the product.  

Built-in furniture – flush fit
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Min airflow gap 
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A 45mm ventilation gap must be left between the built-in 
cabinetry and wall with no back panelling on the cabinet 
housing the microwave oven. A minimum ventilation gap 
of 3.5mm must be left between the bottom of the front 
trim and adjacent shelf/cupboard.

Failure to accommodate for this gap in the installation  
can cause product malfunctions which are not covered 
under warranty

Side view 45mm

6mm packer

Please note 
packer must be 
set back 20mm 
from front trim to 
avoid obstruction 
of front vent. 
Packer must be 
secured to base 
of cabinet.
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Flush fit top view

infill panel 
350mm max. length

20mm

600mm Cupboard  
door

Cupboard  
door

Infill panels are recessed 20mm from the external cabinet 
door to accommodate flush fit.
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